Christian County Commission April 24, 2008

Convene

Presiding Commissioner John Grubaugh called the meeting of the County Commission to order at 9:00 a.m. on April 24, 2008 at the County Commission Office. Attendance: John Grubaugh, Present: Bill Barnett, Present: Tom Huff, Present.

9:30 a.m. Bid Opening -- Common I and Common II RE: Rock and Asphalt

Those present for the meeting: Donna Baxter, Springfield Newsleader, Scott Hilton Clever Stone/Donelson Construction, Danny Garbee, Billings Special Road District, Kelly Vaught, APAC, Scott Crabtree, Blevins Asphalt, and Scott Grider, Common 2 Road District.

The Commission opened bids for Rock and Asphalt for Common I and Common II from the following companies:

Bailey's Quarries, Inc.	Per Ton
Commercial dirty base-rock	k 6.55
Clean base-rock 1"	6.95
Base rock 1 1/2"	6.75
Base rock 0-6	8.00
Chips-5/8	11.00
Chips-1/2	11.00
Chips-3/8	10.50
Chips- 3/4	10.00
Chips- 1/4	10.50
Shot Rock	8.25
Blevins	Per Ton
Commercial dirty base-rock	N/B
Clean base-rock 1"	N/B
Base rock 1 1/2"	N/B
Base rock 0-6	N/B
Chips-5/8	N/B
Chips-1/2	N/B
Chips-3/8	N/B
Chips- 3/4	N/B
Chips- 1/4	N/B
Shot Rock	N/B
Asphalt at Plant	\$ 50.00
Asphalt - Laid	N/B
Hot Crack Fill - lb	N/B
Cold Mix FOB	\$ 42.00
<u>APAC - MO</u>	
Commercial dirty base-rock	\$ 6.60
Clean base-rock 1"	\$ 9.85

2"-4" Clean	\$ 7.50
Base rock 0-6	\$ 3.15
2" Clean	\$ 8.25
1" Clean	\$ 9.85
1/2" Clean	\$13.20
2" Commercial Base	\$ 6.60
1" Commercial Base	\$ 6.60
4-6" Clean	\$ 7.50
0-6" Base	\$ 3.15
18" Rip Rap	\$ 3.15
Shot Rock	\$ 5.80
Asphalt at Plant	\$ 41.75
Asphalt - Laid	\$ 43.40
Hot Crack Fill - lb	N/B
Cold Mix FOB	N/B

Leo Journagan Construction

Commercial dirty base-rock	\$ 6.25
Clean base-rock 1"	\$ 6.60
Base rock 1 1/2"	\$ 6.60
Base rock 0-6	
Chips-5/8	
Chips-1/2	\$ 9.90
Chips-3/8	
Chips- 3/4	\$ 9.60
Chips- 1/4	
Shot Rock	\$ 7.25
Asphalt at Plant	\$ 37.50
Asphalt - Laid	\$ 37.89/to
=	

\$ 37.89/ton & psc N/B

Hot Crack Fill - lb Cold Mix FOB N/B

All aggregates at plant - Ozark Location No Haul Included

CLEVER STONE

Commercial dirty base-rock	\$ 6.00
Clean base-rock 1"	\$ 6.70
Base rock 1 1/2"	\$ 6.70
Base rock 0-6	\$ 6.70
Chips-5/8	\$ 9.50
Chips-1/2	\$ 9.50
Chips-3/8	\$ 9.50
Chips- 3/4	\$ 9.00
Chips- 1/4	\$ 10.50
Shot Rock	\$ 6.00
Asphalt at Plant	
Asphalt - Laid (MC-800 Cold Mix)	\$ 49.90/ton plus haul attached
Hot Crack Fill - lb	\$ 4.17
Cold Mix FOB (MC-800)	\$ 45.85

9:00 a.m. Bid Opening For Chip and Seal -- Common I and Common II

Those present for the meeting: Donna Baxter, of the Springfield Newsleader, Scott Hilton of Clever Stone/Donelson Construction, Danny Garbee of Billings Special Road District, Kelly Vaught from APAC, Scott Crabtree of Blevins Asphalt, and Scott Grider of Common 2 Road District.

The Commission opened bids for chip and seal from the following companies.

BLEVINS: EAST SIDE:

MAC 400

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 0.915 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 2.08

EA-90P

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 0.835 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 1.93

EA-90

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 0.80 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 1.855

Fog Seal SSID \$2.49

Micro Seal no bid Vacuum for gravel no bid

WEST SIDE:

MAC 400

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 0.91

Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$2.07

EA-90P

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 0.83 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 1.92

EA-90

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 0.795 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 1.845

Fog Seal

\$ 2.49

Micro Seal

no bid

Vacuum for gravel, cul-de-dacs no bid

CLEVER STONE --EAST SIDE

MAC 400

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$1.22 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$2.66

EA-90P

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 1.05 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 2.29

EA-90

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 0.96 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 2.10

Fog Seal SSID \$4.30

Micro Seal \$2.41 non-residential

Carbonseal Micro \$ 0.81

Micro Seal \$ 2.98 residential

Carbonseal Micro \$ 1.24

Vacuum for gravel \$ 150.00

EA-90 PLUS

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 1.02 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 2.19

WEST SIDE:

MAC 400

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 1.19 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 2.60

EA-90P

Single Coat of Chip & Seal

\$ 1.02

Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 2.24

EA-90

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 0.93 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 2.04

Fog Seal SSID \$4.30

Micro Seal \$2.41 non-residential Carbon Seal Micro \$0.81

(square yard) \$ 2.98 residential Carbon Seal Micro \$ 1.24

Vacuum for gravel \$ 150.00

EA-90 PLUS

Single Coat of Chip & Seal

\$ 0.99

Double Coat of Chip & Seal

APAC

EAST SIDE:

MAC 400

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 0.94 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 2.157

Single Coat of Chip & Seal

\$ 0.855 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 1.998

EA-90

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 0.7.96 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 1.869

Fog Seal SSID \$2.15

Micro Seal no bid Vacuum for gravel \$ 325.00 per hour

WEST SIDE:

MAC 400

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 0.926

Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 2.147

EA-90P

Single Coat of Chip & Seal

\$ 0.863

Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 2.02

EA-90

Single Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 0.804 Double Coat of Chip & Seal \$ 1.902

Fog Seal SSID \$2.15

Vacuum for gravel \$ 325.00 per hour Micro Seal no bid

The Commission will take these under advisment and will make a decision later.

Ordinance - 04-24-08-01 -

Lenape Road -- 10:00 a.m. The Commission approved and signed the Right of Way Warranty Deed for Lenape Road to be transferred to Billings Special Road District for future development. The Grantors are Gary and Susan Mitchell.

Motion/Vote - Approve the Bid from Clever Stone for Cold Mix and Hot Crack Seal

Western Commissioner Bill Barnett made a motion to accept the bid for Common 1 and Common 2 Road Districts from Clever Stone for the cold mix and the hot crack seal and for the microseal vacuum of cul de sacs and some county roads at a cost of \$ 150.00 per hour. Tom Huff seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote: John Grubaugh (Yes), Bill Barnett (Yes), Tom Huff (Yes).

Motion/Vote - Approve Chip and Seal for Common 1 and Common 2 Road Districts

Eastern Commissioner Tom Huff made a motion to accept the bid from APAC for the EA 90 (single coat chip and seal) and the Fog Seal for the East Side. For the West side APAC will provide the Fog Seal. The West side also accepted the bid from Blevins Asphalt for the single and the double coat of EA90, MAC 400

and EA90P. The East Side accepted the bid from Blevins for the MAC 400, EA90, and EA90P for the double coat. Bill Barnett seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote: John Grubaugh (Yes), Bill Barnett (Yes), Tom Huff (Yes).

Motion/Vote - Approve Bid from Journagan Construction for Asphalt for Common 1 and Common 2

Eastern Commissioner Tom Huff made a motion to accept the bid for asphalt at the plant and asphalt laid from Journagan Construction for Common 1 and Common 2 Road Districts. Bill Barnett seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote: John Grubaugh (Yes), Bill Barnett (Yes), Tom Huff (Yes).

Motion/Vote - Approve the All Bids for Rock for Common 1 and Common 2 Road Districts

Western Commissioner Bill Barnett made a motion to accept all rock bids from the following companies: Clever Stone, Bailey's, Blevins Construction, APAC-MO and Journagan Construction. The quarry selection will be based on the closest to the job site. Tom Huff seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote: John Grubaugh (Yes), Bill Barnett (Yes), Tom Huff (Yes).

10:30 a.m. Kay Brown, County Clerk -- Destruction of Records

County Clerk, Kay Brown has notified the Commission of the following records that will destroyed pursuant the Secretary of State Retention Schedule dated this 24th day of April 2008:

2004 Accounts Payable Records 10 Boxes

2002 Financial Disclosure Reports for:

Missouri Progression Committee

Ozark Cares about Kids

Committee to Election Kathy Blunt for Christian County Clerk

Committee to Elect Retha Clemons

John Bross Treasurer

Committee to Elect Danny Clinton

Vote Yes Monnitee

Carolyn (Kay) Brown

Elwell for State Representative

Committee to Elect Collignon, Judge

Committee to Elect Brad Eldridge

Southwestern Bell Mo Employees Political Action Committee

Bruce Harris

Forgey for State Representative

Committee to Elect Rick Fitzpatrick

Mark Orr for Judge

Ted Nichols

Roy Meadows

Committee for Martin

Committee to Elect Spence for Prosecutor

Citizens to Elect Donald watts

John Waters

Committee to Elect Glenn Scott

Committee to Elect Frank Houser

Committee to Elect Sam Yarnell

Committee to Elect John Grubaugh

* Payroll Records:

1993 W-2 Federal and State Reports

1994 W-2 Year to Date Reports

1995-2001 Employees W-2 Forms

1990-1991 W-2 Witholding - Federal

1993 State Witholding

1982-1984 Insurance Witholding

1982-1984 Social Security Witholding

1982-1984 State Witholding

1982-1984 Federal Witholding

1990-1992 Health Insurance Witholding

1993 Health Insurance Witholding

1976-1981 Quarterly Returns of Witheld Federal Tax

1986 Social Security Witholding

1995 Federal FICA and MC Witholding

1996 MO-941 Witholding

1994-1995 State Witholding

1994 Federal Witholding Tax

1994 Witholding Tax

1992 Employee Quaterly Federal Tax Witholding Returns

Motion/Vote - Approve the Minutes for April 14th and April 21, 2008

Eastern Commissioner Tom Huff made a motion to approve the minutes for April 14th and April 21, 2008. Bill Barnett seconded the motion. The motion passed by vote: John Grubaugh (Yes), Bill Barnett (Yes), Tom Huff (Yes).

11:00 a.m. Karen Matthews, County Treasurer

RE: Destruction of Records

The Commission met with County Treasurer, Karen Matthews to place in the minutes the following 2003 records that were picked up and destroyed on April 16th, 2008, by Jim McPherson.

JANUARY - DECEMBER 2003

January-December Bill of Costs

January-December Matured CD's and Paperwork

January-December Copies of Court Orders

January-December Clerk's Reports

January-December CERF Reports

January-December Pledge Copies

January-December CART Reports

January-December Collector's Reports and Paperwork

January-December Sales Tax (County Revenue, Cole, & Building Bond)

January 2, 2003-December 31, 2003 Deposit Slip Books-County Revenue

January 2, 2003-December 19, 2003 Deposit Slip Books-School

February 4, 2003-October 10, 2003 Deposit Slip Book-Criminal

January-December Weekly Account Balances

January-December Bank Statements, Canceled Checks (County Revenue, School, Criminal Costs, & Sheriff)

County Revenue Check Stubs 11904-12363

April 24, 2008 6

School Check Stubs 9580-9792

Criminal Check Stubs 2536-2557

January-December Prosecuting Attorney's Mo Dept of Rev Reports

January-December Family Violence Check Requests

January-December Receipts and Paperwork #14455-15459

January-December Bank Reconciliations & Interest Earned-Co Rev, School, & Criminal Funds

January-August Bank Reconciliations-Sheriff Fund

January-December General Fund and Road Account Balances

January Financial Institution Tax Interest

January Financial Institution Tax

December BKD Audit Confirmation for Ozark Bank Balances

Jan, Mar, & May Jury Fee Reimbursement Statement

January-December Monthly Summary of Settlement for All Funds, Schools, & Roads

January-December Purchase Orders

COURT ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI

} ss.

COUNTY OF CHRISTIAN

In the Christian County Commission of said County, on the 22nd, day of April 2008, the following, among other proceedings were had, viz:

THE TREASURER IS HEREBY ORDERED TO TRANSFER IN THE AMOUNT OF \$ 100,000.00, FROM GENERAL REVENUE TO THE FOLLOWING:

COLE (Leaving a balance of \$400,000.00)

COURT ORDER

STATE OF MISSOURI

} ss

COUNTY OF CHRISTIAN

April Term, 2008

In the Christian County Commission of said County, on the 22nd day of April 2008, the following, among other proceedings, were had, viz:

THE TREASURER IS HEREBY ORDERED TO TRANSFER THE SUM OF \$ 102,998.29 FROM THE COUNTY REVENUE CART FUND TO THE FOLLOWING:

BRIDGE \$ 15,449.74

ROAD DISTRICTS

COMMON ROAD #1	\$ 30,764.56	COMMON ROAD #2	\$ 30,186.75
BILLINGS SPECIAL	\$ 10,689.68	GARRISON SPECIAL	\$ 2,206.22
OZARK SPECIAL	\$ 8.641.04	SELMORE SPECIAL	\$ 3,414.39

604.08

CERTIFICATION OF THE APRIL 2008 ELECTION

I, Kay Brown, Christian County Clerk do hereby certifiy the following results for Christian County of the April 2008 Municipal Election that was held on April 8, 2008.

CHRISTIAN COUNTY HEALTH DEPARTMENT NON-ELECTION ELECTION FOR (3 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 4- YEAR TERM)

TIMOTHY SEBOLDT	2008 2012
CHARLES E. POWELL	2008 2012
CHRISTINE JONES	2008 2012
	School District of Christian County, Missouri
3 DIRECTORS FOR A THI	REE YEAR TERM
LINDA L. DAUGHERTY	883 Votes Received
SCOTT G. McDonald	821 Votes Received
DAN KNIGHT	804Votes Received
DEBBIE MOORE	740Votes Received
ANTHONY ROBERTS	604Votes Received
GARRETT DOWDY	461 Votes Received
GARRETT DOWDT	401 Yoles Received
Spokane R-VII Scho	ool District of Christian County, Missouri
3 DIRECTORS FOR A	A THREE YEAR TERM
DWAYNE BRADFORD	Votes Received
CLAYTON COOPER	215 Votes Received
ELLIOTT LiaBRATTEN	195 Votes Received
JAMES HARP	101 Votes Received
Dillings D 4 Sahoo	l District of Christian County, Missouri
3 DIRECTORS FOR A TH	HREE YEAR TERM
b binder one round	
KURT HARTER	292 Votes Received
SAM SCHAUMANN	280 Votes Received
SCOTT CHASTAIN	264 Votes Received
BRIAN BENGSCH	248 Votes Received
BRITINGSON	2.0
	ool District of Christian County, Missouri
3 DIRECTO	RS FOR A THREE YEAR TERM
JOSH GILBERT	158Received
TOM ROZELL	150Received
DAVID WALKER	111Received
	96Received
RAYMOND STEVENS	
LEE JOHNSON	74 Received

Clever R-V School District of Christian County, Missouri 3 DIRECTORS FOR A THREE YEAR TERM

161 M. to Decelor
151 Votes Received
148 Votes Received
142 Votes Received
64 Votes Received
52 Votes Received
District of Christian County, Missouri
S FOR A THREE YEAR TERM
17 Votes Received
17 Votes Received
2 Votes Received
strict of Christian County, Missouri
S FOR A THREE YEAR TERM
0 Votes Received
ol District of Christian County, Missouri
S FOR A THREE YEAR TERM
0 Votes Received
0 Votes Received 0 Votes Received
0 Votes Received
0 Votes Received
School Board of Christian County, Missouri.
S FOR A THREE YEAR TERM
36 Votes Received
33 Votes Received
28 Votes Received
21 Votes Received
ict of Webster and Christian County, Missouri.
S FOR A THREE YEAR TERM
4 Votes Received
4 Votes Received
1 Vote Received
1 Votes Received
1 Vote Received
0 Votes Received
0 Votes Received
0 Votes Received
and the second second

Bradleyville R-1 School District of Christian County, Missouri NON-ELECTION ELECTION (115.124 AND SB 686-2003) 3 DIRECTORS FOR A THREE YEAR TERM

ROBERT TAYLOR	
GREG JOHNSON	
REX CLEMANS	
Ozark R-VI Schoo 3 DIRECTO	ol District of Christian County, Missouri. DRS FOR A THREE YEAR TERM
LAURA JOHNSON	964 Votes Received
KIMBERLY MADDOX	554 Votes Received
FRANKIE FORGEY	545 Votes Received
WILLIAM T. GRAY	507 Votes Received
BOB BURGESS	429 Votes Received
LYNNE YAGGY	392 Votes Received
	QUESTION
operating tax levy ceiling of the District to 2008 calendar year and to \$ 3.2400 per or year to fund general operating costs? If the District will increase by \$ 0.10 from \$ 3.00 per or year.	No. 6 of Christian County, Missouri, be authorized to increase the o \$3.1639 per one hundred dollars of assessed valuation for the ne hundred dollars of assessed valuation for the 2009 calendar his proposition is approved, the adjusted operating levy of the 2639 currently to \$3.1639 per one hundred dollars of assessed increase an additional \$0.0761 in calendar year 2009.
YES 772 Votes Received	NO 534 Votes Received
	ool District of Christian County, Missouri. DRS FOR A THREE YEAR TERM
DANNY RAINS	247 Votes Received
GERALD CLAY LOVELAND	231 Votes Received
DWIGHT COBB	198 Votes Received
DAVID JOHNSON	196 Votes Received
GARY WIGGINS	161 Votes Received
City of Highl	andville, Christian County, Missouri.
	d I Alderman
1 Alderm	an for 2 Year Term
JIM WEBSTER	37 Votes Received
BRYAN NICHOLS	34 Votes Received
	Alderman
1 Alderman	for 1 Year Term
CLINT O. ELLINGSWORTH	48 Votes Received
GEORGE L. PEZONLD	22 Votes Received
GEORGE E. TEZOTIZE	
11 442 4	2 Alderman for 2 Year Term
	19 Votes Received 2 Alderman
1 Alderman	for 1 Year Term
CHARLES A. REES	16 Votes Received

City of Clever, Christian County, Missouri CLEVER MAYOR FOR 2 YEAR TERM

TRISH ELAM	55	Vot	otes Received
EAST WAR	D AL	DER	RMAN FOR 2 YEAR TERM
SHAWN STOCKSTILL		29	Votes Received
EAST WARD	ALD	ERM	MAN FOR 1 YEAR TERM
CHRIS MONTGOMERY	TO B # 4 7		Votes Received
WEST WARD ALDEPATTSY BACON			otes Received
City of Sparta, Christi SPARTA MAYOR F			
MIKE YOUNKER			187 Votes Received
M.J. "SNOOK" BRADEN JAY NICHOLS	Ī		61 Votes Received16 Votes Received
WARD I ALDERN	1AN C	CANI	DIDATES FOR 2 YEAR TERM
ELIZABETH GILLAN		43	3 Votes Received
GEORGE BLAISDELL		21	1 Votes Received
JAMES CAMPBELL		20	0 Votes Received
BRIAN DUVALL		19	
WARD 2 ALDERN	MAN (CANI	IDIDATES FOR 2 YEAR TERM
RUSSELL JONES		85	5 Votes Received
CHRISTIN CORLESS		44	4 Votes Received
JENNIFER BUCKLEY		25	5 Votes Received
City of Billings, OMAYOR FO			County, Missouri R TERM
KHARISSA PETRAS ROBERT PAUL ANDERSON	10	6 Vo	otes Received 93 Votes Received
WARD I ALDERMAN C	ANDI	DAT	TE FOR 2 YEAR TERM
ROGER R. RUFER	49	Vo	otes Received
WARD II ALDER	MAN	CAN	NDIDATE FOR 2 YEAR TERM
DONNA THOMAS	48	Vo	otes Received
WARD III ALDERMAN C	ANDI	DAT	TE FOR 2 YEAR TERM
BUD PIERCE	68 V	otes R	Received
April 24 2008			11

City of Fremont Hills, Christian County, Missouri MAYOR FOR 2 YEAR TERM

RON ELKINS, JR.	78 Votes Received	
WARD MAX STEWART	1 ALDERMAN FOR 2 YEAR TERM 28 Votes Received	
WARD II AI	DERMAN CANDIDATE FOR 2 YEAR TERM	
STEVE WHISLER	33 Votes Received	
WARD III ALI	DERMAN CANDIDATE FOR 2 YEAR TERM	
KEVIN THURO	12 Votes Received	
BRIAN HAYES MARK SELLENRIEK STEVE TALLAKSEN	of Nixa, Christian County, Missouri MAYOR FOR 2 YEAR TERM 490 Votes Received 393 Votes Received 313 Votes Received	
JEFF LOFTON (WRITE-IN)	9 Votes Received	
WARD	1 ALDERMAN FOR 2 YEAR TERM	
MICHAEL DURBIN MARK LOGE	249 Votes Received 206 Votes Received	
WAR	D II ALDERMAN FOR 2 YEAR TERM	
BARB STILLINGS JAY JONES MICHAEL T. MCDERMOTT	201 Votes Received 106 Votes Received 86 Votes Received RD III ALDERMAN FOR 2 YEAR TERM	
KEVIN ELMER	146 Votes Received	
KEVIN CHEFFEY	143 Votes Received	
v	of Ozark, Christian County, Missouri 1 ALDERMAN FOR 2 YEAR TERM	
MARK SPINABELLA	116 Votes Received	
WARD II ALD	DERMAN CANDIDATE FOR 2 YEAR TERM	
DENNIS E. SPARROW JAY JOHNSON BRUCE GALLOWAY	97 Votes Received 90 Votes Received 57 Votes Received	
WARD III ALDERMAN	CANDIDATE FOR 2 YEAR TERM	
MIKE ESTERL April 24, 2008	42 Votes Received	12

RICHARD GERMEROTH		16 Votes Received		
RYAN MADDOX	2	` Votes Received		
CHARLES DOAN	2	Votes Received		
MIKE ALDERMAN	1	Vote Received		
DAMION SMITH	1	Vote Received		
CHARLES MARTIN	1	Vote Received		
CLINTON HARRIS	1	Vote Received		
CLAUDE KINSER	1	Vote Received		
FAWN WARNER	1	Vote Received		
TODD JOHNSON	1	Vote Received		
GERALD VIGNEAUX, JR.		1 Vote Received		
ANTHONY MARTIN	1	Vote Received		
HOWL YOUNG	1 Vo	te Received		
HAROLD YOUNG	1	Vote Received		
City of Republic, Christian County, Missouri MAYOR FOR 2 YEAR TERM				
BRIAN BUCKNER	5	Votes Received		
WARD 4	COUNC	ILMAN FOR 2 YEAR TERM		
DANIEL HARTER	5	Votes Received		
JIM HUNTSINGER	2	Votes Received		
	(QUESTION		
Shall the City of Republic, Missouri, impose a sales tax at the rate of three-eighths of one percent (3/8 of 1%) to be collected for the purpose of funding economic development with such tax implementation to be contingent upon council approval of a reduction of the City's general real property tax assessment from approximately .4453 cents to approximately .1113 before the effective date of the tax, February 1, 2009?				
O YES 5	Votes R	Received		
0 NO 0	Votes R	Received		
Ozark Technical Community College, of Christian County, Missouri. (Vote for TWO for a 6 year term)				
J. HOWARD FISK	1.7	15 Votes Received		
MARYELLEN STRATMAN	,	1,142 Votes Received		
JEANETTE R. UNSELL		952 Votes Received		
DAN MANNA	8	54 Votes Received		
\\Billings Special R	oad Distr	rict of Christian County, Missouri		
		ECTION FOR		
(1 BOARD MEMBER 3 YEAR TERM)				

DAVID MOONEYHAM

Highlandville Fire Protection District of Christian County, Missouri.

QUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION

April 24, 2008 13

STEVE MILLER - 6 YEAR 2008-2014 RICK FARLEY - 6 YEAR 2008-2014

Logan-Rogersville Fire Protection District of Christian County, Missouri QUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION ELECTION (1 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 6 YEAR TERM)

KEITH BAXTER Clever Fire Protection District of Christian County, Missouri **QUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION FOR** (1 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 6 YEAR TERM) WESLEY BRUCE BUEHLER 6 YEAR TERM 2008-2014 NICOLE CELESTE 6 YEAR TERM 2008-2014 (1 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 4 YEAR TERM) LLOYD D. WALLES, JR. 4 YEAR TERM 2008-2012 Christian County Ambulance District of Christian County Missouri. **DISTRICT #5** (1 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 3 YEAR TERM) **DENNIS CLINTON** 212 Votes Received JASON PRESTON 188 Votes Received NON-ELECTION ELECTION (115.124 AND SB 686-2003) **DISTRICT #2** (1 BOARD MEMBER FOR A THREE YEAR TERM) IVAN C. ALLEN Nixa Area Emergency 911 Board of Christian County, Missouri. **OUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION FOR** (4 BOARD MEMBERS FOR A 4 YEAR TERM) JOSEPH D. HARSHBERGER - ROSEDALE TOWNSHIP 2008-2012 2008-2012 EVELYN S. REYNOLDS - UNION CHAPEL TOWNSHIP RON SHAWGO - GARDEN GROVE TOWNSHIP 2008-2012 JACK MOORE - NORTHVIEW TOWNSHIP 2008-2012 Brookline Fire Protection District of Christian County, Missouri QUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION (2 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 6 YEAR TERM) 2008-2014 Kirk Larson Kevin Moore 2008-2014 Sparta Fire Protection District of Christian County, Missouri

QUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION (2 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 6 YEAR TERM)

Wilfred C. Lee, Jr.

2008-2014

Pletcher Rogers

2008-2014

Christian County Public Water District #1 of Christian County, Missouri.

QUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION

(2 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 3 YEAR TERM)

JOHN HAWKS

JOHN ESSICK

Ozark Special Road District of Christian County, Missouri QUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION (1 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 3 YEAR TERM)

EDWARD F. ADDINGTON

Garrison Special Road District of Christian County, Missouri.

QUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION

(1 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 3 YEAR TERM)

MIKE MITCHELL

Nixa Special Road District of Christian County, Missouri
QUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION
(1 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 3 YEAR TERM)

DARYL MITCHELL

Sparta Special Road District of Christian County, Missouri.
QUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION
(1 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 3 YEAR TERM)

PHIL T. SHORT

Stoneshire Special Road District of Christian County, Missouri.

QUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION

(1 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 3 YEAR TERM)

GERALD J. BELLOVARY

Selmore Special Road District of Christian County, Missouri.

QUALIFIED FOR A NON-ELECTION

(1 BOARD MEMBER FOR A 3 YEAR TERM)

SHANE VASS

Nixa Fire Protection District of Christian County, Missouri.

QUALIFIED FOR A NONELECTION-ELECTION (2 BOARD MEMBERS FOR A SIX YEAR TERM)

BARBARA RAE HUGHES

2008-2014

2008-2014

BOR KORINO		2008-2014
Billings Fir DARREN FABRO JIM SPIVY	re Protection District, CI (1 Board Member for a S 354 VOTES 77 VOTES	nristian County, Missouri Bix Year Term)
ROB VERCH JANICE BLUEBAUM	(1 Board Member for a 329 VOTES 104 VOTES	n Four Year Term)
Signatures John Grubaugh/Presiding Commission	ioner	